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St Patrick’s Mental Health Services (SPMHS) is Ireland’s largest independent, not-for-
profit mental health service provider. St Patrick’s Mental Health Services’ vision is for 
a society where all citizens are given the opportunity to live mentally healthy lives. 
SPMHS works to provide the highest quality mental healthcare, to promote mental 
wellbeing and mental health awareness, and to advocate for the rights of those 
experiencing mental health difficulties. SPMHS achieves this through a human rights-
based approach, through the enhancement of evidence-based knowledge and by 
striving to be at the cutting edge of new initiatives and advances in the field.  

SPMHS is committed to furthering the development of the competencies of those 
choosing to work in mental health and of the organisations providing mental 
healthcare services, and to enhancing partnership with service users. Our strategic 
plan for 2018-2022 – ‘Changing Minds. Changing Lives’, is firmly rooted in these 
principles and commitments1.  

 
SPMHS welcomes the opportunity to contribute to the Department of Justice and 
Equality’s consultation to inform the development of a national flexible working 
policy. This submission will focus on aspects of the consultation that may be 
particularly pertinent to mental health. 
 
 
Work and Mental Health 

 
As with other areas of life, work and mental health are inter-related and a satisfying 

and meaningful work-life is a key part of both maintaining good mental health and of 

recovery from mental health difficulties.  Meaningful work can positively affect factors 

including self-esteem, self-confidence and social participation2. Conversely work-

related stress and various work-associated risk factors have been identified as relevant 

to the development of mental health difficulties, with working conditions identified as 

a significant modifiable risk factor3. It may thus be helpful to emphasise the 

importance of choice and individual preferences or susceptibilities in the 

implementation of flexible working within a workplace – for example, a remote 

working arrangement may work well for one person while for another being in a 

sociable work environment and not being isolated may be essential to thrive and 

maintain good mental health.  

The broader relevance of work-life balance within the context of the EU Directive on 
Work-Life Balance for Parents and Carers is understandably highlighted in the 
consultation document4, however SPMHS would also suggest that the links between 
work-life balance and maintaining good mental health for all could be valuably 
addressed in developing the strategy.  
 
Reasonable accommodations  
 
SPMHS welcomes the focus on the relevance of flexible working for people with 
disabilities outlined in the consultation document5. SPMHS advocates that the State’s  



 

 
 

 
 
obligations under the United Nations Convention on the Rights of Persons with 
Disabilities (UNCRPD)6 should be a key influence on informing the development of a 
flexible working policy, in the context of both facilitating access to employment for 
people with disabilities and supporting working people who have or acquire a 
disability. Flexible working is an example of reasonable accommodation - an 
obligation on employers as set out in Article 27 of the UNCRPD7, the EU’s Employment 
Equality Directive8, and under national legislation in the Employment Equality Act9. 
Flexible working arrangements including modified working schedules, flexitime and 
remote working, may be particularly pertinent for people with a mental health 
difficulty or psychosocial disability but awareness and understanding amongst 
employers regarding the relevance of such accommodations can be limited10. 
 
The development of a national policy on flexible working could prove a valuable 
opportunity to increase awareness of the rights and obligations of employees and 
employers respectively regarding the importance and nature of reasonable 
accommodations for people with ongoing mental health difficulties. However, a fear 
of disclosing a need for reasonable accommodations due to mental health difficulties 
and experiencing subsequent discrimination from employers has been identified as a 
barrier to reaping the benefits of such accommodations11. Thus, it is essential that 
meaningful attention to eliminating discrimination on the grounds of psychosocial or 
other disability in the workplace, be incorporated into the policy.  
 
 
 
END 
 
Louise O’Leary, Advocacy Manager, SPMHS 
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